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     Skill / Employability/ Entrepreneurship Activities

Department of PG studies and Research in Commerce has organised one day workshop on
SPSS for Data Analysis on 02-12-2022 at Seminar Hall -1, SDM PG Centre, Ujire. Dr. Sunil
D’souza, Assistant professor, St. Philomena College, Mysore, was this workshop's resource
person. Students of II M.Com, II M.Com (IBM), I M.Com and I M.Com (IBM) participated in
the workshop.



Department of PG Studies and Research in Commerce has rganized one day workshop on
Stock  Market  on  07-01-2023.  Dr.  Kushalappa  S,  Assistant  Professor,  Government  First
Grade  College,  Belthangady  was  the  resource  person  for  the  workshop.  He  dealt  with
basics of stock market and about to trade in stock market. All the students of II M.Com and
I M.Com participated in this workshop. 

On 09-01-2023, Department of PG Studies and Research in Commerce has organised one
day workshop on Problem identification and Research Writing at AV-01, SDM PG Centre,



Ujire. Dr. Chidananda H L, Assistant Professor, School of Economics and Commerce, CMR
University,  Bengaluru  was  the  resource  person  for  the  same.  Students  of  II  M.Com,  II
M.Com (IBM) and I M.Com were participated in this program.

The Department of  PG Studies  and Research in Commerce organized a One-day online
workshop on `Data Analytics using Excel` in AV - 1, for the II M. Com students on 22nd June
2023,  under  the  guidance  of  Dr.  Priya  Kumari  S  V,  Head  of  the  department  and  the
faculties, Department of PG Studies and Research in Commerce. The resource person of this
workshop was Dr. Muruganandan S, Assistant Professor, Directorate of Online Education,
Manipal University Jaipur, Rajasthan.  In this training session, he gave information about
how to work in Excel sheets, how the corporate field wants a technical expert in Excel and
how MS Excel enables users to identify trends and organize and sort data into meaningful
categories.  The  resource  person  gave  the  information  to  the  students  regarding
calculation and data entry. This practical session gave the knowledge about how to work
in Excel,  what are all  the shortcuts we can use and the practical part of elements like
conditional formatting, logical functions, statistical functions, charts, financial formulas
and vlookup functions



The  Department  of  PG  Studies  and  Research  in  Commerce  and  Masters’  Passion
Association organised National Level Online Product Launch Competition – MAGNUS on
15-06-2023.  The  online  competition  held  in  webinar  hall,  SDM  College  Ujire  by  the
guidance  of  Dr.  Priya  Kumari  S  V,  Head of  the  Department  and Mr.  Harshith  Kumar,
Assistant  Professor,  Department  of  PG  Studies  and  Research  in  Commerce  and  other
faculties.  The  inaugural  ceremony  was  started  at  10.15  am,  inaugurated  by  Dr.
Vishwanatha P, Dean, SDM PG Centre, Ujire. The presidential speech was given by Dr. B A
Kumara Hegde, Principal,  SDM College Ujire.  There were 11 teams participated in this
competition.  This  online product launch competition judged by Mr.  Ashwith H R,  HOD,
Department of B.Voc in Retail and Supply Chain Management and Mr. Harshith Kumar,
Assistant Professor, Department of PG Studies and Research in Commerce. This National
level  online  product  launch  competition  winner  was  Ms.  Saamya Sukumaran and Mr.
Harshendra Jain from SDM College Ujire, first runners Ms. Gayathri S and Mr. Mithun Raj A
from Mangalore University Konaje, second runners Mr. Narasimha Kini and Mr. Dheeraj k
from Vivekananda college of Art, Science & Commerce, Puttur.


